
VOLVO A40G 340668 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP4508658
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 11129484Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Jul 2024
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06240650 (Generated: 07/19/2024 11:06:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP4508658 VCP416754 VCP419854 ---Sample Date 09 Jul 2024 08 Feb 2024 01 Aug 2023 ---Machine Hours 17948 17181 16113 ---Oil Hours 767 1068 1081 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 135 135 138 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 1 2 1 ---Sodium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Potassium ppm 1 1 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 5 5 ---Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 4 <1 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 0 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 3 1 2 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 193 300 137 ---Magnesium ppm 16 10 12 ---Zinc ppm 89 125 58 ---Phosphorus ppm 1069 960 1014 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 205 158 218 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06240650 (Generated: 07/19/2024 11:06:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340668\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP4508658] 09 Jul 2024 @ 17948.0 hrs

