
VOLVO A40G 340668 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP447701
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No:

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 11129673Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Jul 2024
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06240839 (Generated: 07/22/2024 11:34:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447701 VCP416806 VCP405258 ---Sample Date 09 Jul 2024 08 Feb 2024 24 Oct 2023 ---Machine Hours 17948 17181 16708 ---Oil Hours 767 473 595 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.8 28.6 28.3 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.371 NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 2 2 4 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 0 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 0 6 ---Copper ppm 2 2 3 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 6 8 5 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 80 110 ---Magnesium ppm 0 <1 2 ---Zinc ppm 0 0 8 ---Phosphorus ppm 234 213 258 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 102 134 124 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06240839 (Generated: 07/22/2024 11:34:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340668\Transmission (Auto) [VCP447701] 09 Jul 2024 @ 17948.0 hrs

