
[[381461]] VOLVO G940 41225 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP353348
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 381461

VILLE DE ST-RAYMOND375 RUE ST-JOSEPHST RAYMOND, QCCA  G3L 1A1Contact: 
T: F: (418)337-2203
Diagnostic
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the fluidfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in thefluid. Test for glycol is negative. Thefluid is no longer serviceable due tothe presence of contaminants.

Depot: VILSTRUnique No: 5658749Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
ID du rapport: VILSTR [WCAMIS] 02589683 (Generated: 10/18/2023 10:34:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - VILSTR

 INFORMATION SUR L'éCHANTILLONNuméro d'échant. VCP353348 --- --- ---Date d'échant. 11 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Heures de la Machine 12371 --- --- ---Heures de l'huile 0 --- --- ---Huile changée Not Changd --- --- ---Statut de l'echant. ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 ÉTAT D'HUILEVisc 40°C cSt 30.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONEau % 0.772 --- --- ---Silicium ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 MéTAUX D'USUREFer ppm 58 --- --- ---Cuivre ppm 3 --- --- ---Plomb ppm 8 --- --- ---Étain ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminium ppm 3 --- --- ---Chrome ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdène ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titane ppm 0 --- --- ---Argent ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganèse ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIFSCalcium ppm 159 --- --- ---Magnésium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 143 --- --- ---Phosphore ppm 272 --- --- ---Baryum ppm <1 --- --- ---Bore ppm 83 --- --- ---

Page 1 sur 2



 GRAPHS

ID du rapport: VILSTR [WCAMIS] 02589683 (Generated: 10/18/2023 10:34:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - VILSTR
Page 2 sur 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G940 41225\Transmission (Auto) [VCP353348] 11 Oct 2023 @ 12371.0 hrs

