
01230255 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA039479
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40

G & B Sports Marine Ltd2508 Lakeshore Road WestOAKVILLE, ONCA  L6L 1H8Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP152550Unique No: 5604226Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Jun 2023
Report Id: VP152550 [WCAMIS] 02567180 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:17:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - VP152550

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA039479 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1661 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 15.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 54 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 48 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 44 --- --- ---Copper ppm 40 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 43 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2211 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 77 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 971 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 887 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 149 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152550 [WCAMIS] 02567180 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:17:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - VP152550
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR 01230255\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA039479] 28 Jun 2023 @ 1661.0 hrs

