
NO UNIT VPA031397 - MAIN ENGINE
Sample No: VPA031397
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

BEACON BAY MARINA1-37 CHAMPLAIN RDPENETANGUISHENE, ONCA  L9M 1S1Contact: Murray Cadeaumcadeau@beaconbaymarina.comT: (705)549-2075F: (705)549-2032
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify thecomponent make and model withyour next sample. Please specify thebrand, type, and viscosity of the oilon your next sample.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP728240Unique No: 5607564Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 19 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP728240 [WCAMIS] 02570518 (Generated: 07/19/2023 12:39:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Murray Cadeau - VP728240

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA031397 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 73 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 73 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 28 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2273 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1176 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1004 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 132 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP728240 [WCAMIS] 02570518 (Generated: 07/19/2023 12:39:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Murray Cadeau - VP728240
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO UNIT VPA031397\Main Engine [VPA031397] 17 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

