
[MARK SARRAINO [318872]] 7008483288 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA056627
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40

HINDSON MARINE SERVICE INC79 CHAMPLAIN ROAD, P.O. BOX 5025Penetanguishene, ONCA  L9M 2G2Contact: Pat Walkerptwalker@rogers.comT: (705)330-1082F: (705)549-3138
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm.Metal levels are typical for acomponents first oil change. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: ROB79PENUnique No: 5620336Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 11 Aug 2023
Report Id: ROB79PEN [WCAMIS] 02575285 (Generated: 08/11/2023 15:03:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Pat Walker - ROB79PEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056627 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10 --- --- ---Oil Hours 10 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.4 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 17 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 41 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2325 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 112 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1239 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1118 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 124 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ROB79PEN [WCAMIS] 02575285 (Generated: 08/11/2023 15:03:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Pat Walker - ROB79PEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 7008483288\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA056627] 26 Jul 2023 @ 10.0 hrs

