
[WEILANDW] 3194008155 - PORT TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)
Sample No: VPA055726
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90

101 MARINE REPAIR969 KEITH RDGIBSONS, BCCA  V0N 1V7Contact: Gary Mulligangary@101marinerepair.comT: (604)989-6301F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Iron and nickelppm levels are abnormal. The lowferrous density (PQ) index indicatesthe wear metal levels are due tocorrosion. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: VP99258814Unique No: 5632618Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 01 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP99258814 [WCAMIS] 02579558 (Generated: 09/01/2023 08:02:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Gary Mulligan - VP99258814

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055726 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1917 --- --- ---Oil Hours 120 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 101 --- --- ---Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.1 --- --- ---Viscosity Index (VI) Scale 142 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 21 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 13 --- --- ---Iron ppm 365 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 6 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 20 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1412 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 243 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99258814 [WCAMIS] 02579558 (Generated: 09/01/2023 08:03:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Gary Mulligan - VP99258814
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 3194008155\Port Transmission (Manual) [VPA055726] 14 Aug 2023 @ 1917.0 hrs

