
[WEILANDW] 2006035406 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA055724
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

101 MARINE REPAIR969 KEITH RDGIBSONS, BCCA  V0N 1V7Contact: Gary Mulligangary@101marinerepair.comT: (604)989-6301F: 
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Additivelevels indicate the addition of adifferent brand, or type of oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP99258814Unique No: 5632619Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 01 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP99258814 [WCAMIS] 02579559 (Generated: 09/01/2023 08:03:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Gary Mulligan - VP99258814

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055724 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1878 --- --- ---Oil Hours 170 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 70 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 78 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 16 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 26 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 62 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1083 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1020 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1242 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1118 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99258814 [WCAMIS] 02579559 (Generated: 09/01/2023 08:03:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Gary Mulligan - VP99258814
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 2006035406\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA055724] 14 Aug 2023 @ 1878.0 hrs

