
[[19271]] 13600K - GEAR UNIT
Sample No: VPA049597
Oil Type: ATF

Sea Power Ltd2077 Amelia AveSIDNEY, BCCA  V8L 3Z8Contact: Kayla Sousaservice@seapower.caT: (250)656-4341F: 
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Copper and lead ppmlevels are noted. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. Viscosity of sample indicatesoil is within SAE 10W range, adviseinvestigate. This plus the additivelevels indicates that this is not thesame brand, or type of oil asreported. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP154139Unique No: 5632856Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 01 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP154139 [WCAMIS] 02579796 (Generated: 09/06/2023 07:51:48) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Kayla Sousa - VP154139

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA049597 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 42.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 9 --- --- ---Iron ppm 33 --- --- ---Copper ppm 158 --- --- ---Lead ppm 66 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 49 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 13 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 734 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 550 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 608 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 642 --- --- ---Barium ppm 10 --- --- ---Boron ppm 128 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154139 [WCAMIS] 02579796 (Generated: 09/06/2023 07:51:50) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Kayla Sousa - VP154139
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ZF HURTH 13600K\Gear Unit [VPA049597] 24 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

