
[[R1-22722]] PE4045D547121 - DIESEL FUEL
Sample No: VPA050650
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)

CULLEN DIESEL POWER - 6953359300 192 STSURREY, BCCA  V4N 3R8Contact: Venu Iyervgi@cullendiesel.comT: (604)455-2207F: 
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. Please contactyour representative for informationregarding the proper sampling kitsfor your service.{not applicable} {notapplicable} Not enough samplesubmitted to determine fuelcondition and/or classification.

Depot: CULSURUnique No: 5658880Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Oct 2023
Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02589814 (Generated: 10/18/2023 11:28:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Venu Iyer - CULSUR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA050650 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 445 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITION

Sulfur ppm 10 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02589814 (Generated: 10/18/2023 11:28:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Venu Iyer - CULSUR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE PE4045D547121\Diesel Fuel [VPA050650] 03 Oct 2023 @ 445.0 hrs

