
PORT IPS - PORT TRANSMISSION (AUTO)
Sample No: VPA049806
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Sea Power Ltd2077 Amelia AveSIDNEY, BCCA  V8L 3Z8Contact: Kayla Sousaservice@seapower.caT: (250)656-4341F: 
Diagnosis
Check for low coolant level. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. Check seals and/orfilters for points of contaminantentry. The air breather requiresservice.  If unrated, we recommendthat you replace with a suitablemicron rated and/or desiccant airbreather.  If rated, we recommendthat you service/replace the breather.We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please specifythe brand, type, and viscosity of theoil on your next sample. NOTE: Pleaseprovide information regardingreservoir capacity, filter type andmicron rating with next sample.Ironppm levels are abnormal. Watertreatment chemicals present,indicating slow coolant leak. There isa moderate concentration of waterpresent in the fluid. Free waterpresent. Test for glycol is negative.Abnormal water content andsodium(Na) level indicate possiblesea water contamination. The fluid isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP154139Unique No: 5659476Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 22 Oct 2023
Report Id: VP154139 [WCAMIS] 02590410 (Generated: 10/27/2023 01:24:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kayla Sousa - VP154139

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA049806 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 106 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 175 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 0 --- --- ---Iron ppm 619 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 11 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 19 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 38 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 21 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1360 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 246 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154139 [WCAMIS] 02590410 (Generated: 10/27/2023 01:24:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kayla Sousa - VP154139
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PORT IPS\Port Transmission (Auto) [VPA049806] 18 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

