
[[R1-22610]] MITSUBISHI 24719 - DIESEL FUEL
Sample No: VPA055962
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)

CULLEN DIESEL POWER - 6953359300 192 STSURREY, BCCA  V4N 3R8Contact: MATT GLUBISmjg@cullendiesel.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Please contact your representative forinformation regarding the propersampling kits for your service.{notapplicable} There is no indication ofany contamination in thecomponent(unconfirmed). Notenough sample submitted todetermine fuel condition and/orclassification.

Depot: CULSURUnique No: 5684238Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Nov 2023
Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02599158 (Generated: 11/29/2023 08:52:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT GLUBIS - CULSUR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055962 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 149 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITION

Sulfur ppm 9 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02599158 (Generated: 11/29/2023 08:52:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT GLUBIS - CULSUR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MITSUBISHI MITSUBISHI 24719\Diesel Fuel [VPA055962] 14 Nov 2023 @ 148.7 hrs

