
[INTERFOR CAMPBELL RIVER [80323]] 3100001926 - STERNTUBE
Sample No: VPA050687
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Progressive Diesel2135 Milne RdPORT MCNEIL, BCCA  V0N 2R0Contact: Larry Coxlarry.prodsl@hotmail.caT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)GEAR OIL SAE 75W90.  Pleaseconfirm.Iron ppm levels are severe.Nickel ppm levels are marginal. Thelow ferrous density (PQ) indexindicates the wear metal levels aredue to corrosion. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP153880Unique No: 5733904Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 21 Feb 2024
Report Id: VP153880 [WCAMIS] 02616794 (Generated: 02/21/2024 14:20:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Larry Cox - VP153880

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA050687 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1259 --- --- ---Oil Hours 30 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 104 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 5 --- --- ---Iron ppm 214 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 5 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 14 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1393 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 256 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153880 [WCAMIS] 02616794 (Generated: 02/21/2024 14:20:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Larry Cox - VP153880
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 3100001926\Sterntube [VPA050687] 08 Feb 2024 @ 1259.0 hrs

