
[ANVIL EXCAVATION LTD [R100-24141]] 2006006514 - PORT MAIN ENGINE
Sample No: VPA060322
Oil Type: PETRO CANADA 15W40

CULLEN DIESEL POWER - 6953359300 192 STSURREY, BCCA  V4N 3R8Contact: Michelle Sayersmns@cullendiesel.comT: (604)888-1211F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CULSURUnique No: 5736305Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 01 Mar 2024
Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02619195 (Generated: 03/01/2024 12:58:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michelle Sayers - CULSUR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA060322 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1533 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 56 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 52 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 18 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 57 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1063 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 969 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1164 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1044 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02619195 (Generated: 03/01/2024 12:58:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michelle Sayers - CULSUR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 2006006514\Port Main Engine [VPA060322] 15 Feb 2024 @ 1533.0 hrs

