
[[19624]] 3194008156 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA056523
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Sea Power Ltd2077 Amelia AveSIDNEY, BCCA  V8L 3Z8Contact: Kayla Sousaservice@seapower.caT: (250)656-4341F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)GEAR OIL SAE 75W90.  Pleaseconfirm.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP154139Unique No: 5737358Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 06 Mar 2024
Report Id: VP154139 [WCAMIS] 02620248 (Generated: 03/11/2024 10:36:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kayla Sousa - VP154139

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056523 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1900 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 105 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 0 --- --- ---Iron ppm 83 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 7 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 10 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1387 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 272 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154139 [WCAMIS] 02620248 (Generated: 03/11/2024 10:36:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Kayla Sousa - VP154139
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 3194008156\Port IPS [VPA056523] 04 Mar 2024 @ 1900.0 hrs

