
A222249 - CENTER MAIN ENGINE
Sample No: VPA050507
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA SAE 15W40

STEPHEN COX6 46058 BRIDGE RIDGE CRESCHILLIWACK, BCCA  V2R 5W2Contact: Stephen Coxreskcox@gmail.comT: (604)833-6667F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for visiblemetal particles in the oil. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Light concentration ofvisible metal present. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: STE646CHIUnique No: 5750249Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 02 Apr 2024
Report Id: STE646CHI [WCAMIS] 02625130 (Generated: 04/02/2024 08:46:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Stephen Cox - STE646CHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA050507 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 470 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 55 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 57 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 61 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1101 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 990 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1222 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1044 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 6 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STE646CHI [WCAMIS] 02625130 (Generated: 04/02/2024 08:46:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Stephen Cox - STE646CHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA A222249\Center Main Engine [VPA050507] 17 Mar 2024 @ 470.0 hrs

