
3TNE78AC-KH - GENSET
Sample No: VPA027043
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40

BRANDY`S COVE YACHTING CENTRE105 BRANDY`S ISLAND RDHONEY HARBOR, ONCA  P0E 1E0Contact: Shayne Ronaldsronald@brandyscove.comT: (705)716-3478F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40. Please confirm.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: BRAHONUnique No: 5774079Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 02 May 2024
Report Id: BRAHON [WCAMIS] 02632926 (Generated: 05/02/2024 16:43:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shayne Ronald - BRAHON

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA027043 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 797 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 --- --- ---Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.5 --- --- ---Viscosity Index (VI) Scale 137 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 80 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 82 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 12 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 20 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1606 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 516 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1149 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 978 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 83 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BRAHON [WCAMIS] 02632926 (Generated: 05/02/2024 16:43:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shayne Ronald - BRAHON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOHLER 3TNE78AC-KH\Genset [VPA027043] 29 Apr 2024 @ 796.9 hrs

