
[MDR TRANSPORTATION [R463611]] FREIGHTLINER 3AKJHHDR2LSLR6338 - DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA053437
Oil Type: {unknown}

CULLEN DIESEL POWER - 6953359300 192 STSURREY, BCCA  V4N 3R8Contact: Michelle Sayersgenservice@cullendiesel.comT: (604)888-1211F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Tests indicate thatthere is no fuel present in the oil.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CULSURUnique No: 5785759Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 22 May 2024
Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02636597 (Generated: 05/22/2024 14:06:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michelle Sayers - CULSUR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA053437 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 835318 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 70 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 45 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 35 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1645 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 477 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 873 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 758 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 48 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CULSUR [WCAMIS] 02636597 (Generated: 05/22/2024 14:06:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Michelle Sayers - CULSUR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	FREIGHTLINER FREIGHTLINER 3AKJHHDR2LSLR6338\Diesel Engine [VPA053437] 07 May 2024 @ 835318.0 hrs

