
3194005830 - STARBOARD IPS
Sample No: VPA031376
Oil Type: {unknown}

GBCS - GEORGIAN BAY SERVICES171-8 ROBERT ST EASTPENETANGUISHENE, ONCA  L9M 1G9Contact: James Barrowjames@gbcs.caT: (705)528-9007F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Check sealsand/or filters for points ofcontaminant entry. The air breatherrequires service.  If unrated, werecommend that you replace with asuitable micron rated and/ordesiccant air breather.  If rated, werecommend that you service/replacethe breather. We recommend thatyou drain the oil from the componentif this has not already been done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. Please specifythe brand, type, and viscosity of theoil on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normalindicating ingress of seal material,dirt and/or grease. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: GBCPENUnique No: 5789773Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 10 Jun 2024
Report Id: GBCPEN [WCAMIS] 02640611 (Generated: 06/10/2024 13:03:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: James Barrow - GBCPEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA031376 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 935 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 106 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.402 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 199 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 0 --- --- ---Iron ppm 215 --- --- ---Copper ppm 12 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 6 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 25 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1336 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 250 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GBCPEN [WCAMIS] 02640611 (Generated: 06/10/2024 13:03:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: James Barrow - GBCPEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 3194005830\Starboard IPS [VPA031376] 04 Jun 2024 @ 935.0 hrs

