
[BRIAN JOHNSTON [8194]] FL13769 - DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA053045
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40

CULLEN DIESEL POWER2454 HAYES RDNANAIMO, BCCA  V9T 3M3Contact: Joe Straughanjds@cullendiesel.comT: (250)758-5241F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40.  Pleaseconfirm.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CULNANUnique No: 5813912Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Jul 2024
Report Id: CULNAN [WCAMIS] 02648360 (Generated: 07/18/2024 08:18:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Joe Straughan - CULNAN

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA053045 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Jul 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 66 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1135 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 798 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1213 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1029 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 121 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CULNAN [WCAMIS] 02648360 (Generated: 07/18/2024 08:18:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Joe Straughan - CULNAN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA FL13769\Diesel Engine [VPA053045] 09 Jul 2024 @ .0 hrs

