
[[C-1-E POST AC]] VOLVO PENTA 2016125589 - AUXILIARY CIRCUIT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA258676
Oil Type: CONVENTIONAL COOLANT

POWERSECURE INC1609 HERITAGE COMMERCE CTWAKE FOREST, NCUS  27587Contact: C. CHESLERcchesler@powersecure.comT: (919)556-3056F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the coolingsystem. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP695486Unique No: 9118110Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 05 Aug 2020
Report Id: VP695486 [WUSCAR] 05032949 (Generated: 07/26/2023 08:21:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. CHESLER - VP695486

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA258676 VPA258674 --- ---Sample Date 30 Jul 2020 29 Jul 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 0 0 --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.71 8.65 --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 0 --- ---Percentage Glycol % 48 49 --- ---Freezing Point °C -24 -26 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal normal --- ---Coolant Color Pink Pink --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP695486 [WUSCAR] 05032949 (Generated: 07/26/2023 08:22:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: C. CHESLER - VP695486
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2016125589\Auxiliary Circuit Coolant [VPA258676] 30 Jul 2020 @ .0 hrs

