
A725119 - CENTER DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA022754
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 SDE SAE 15W40

WERNER LEHNER1305 MARINERS PLANACORTES, WAUS  98221Contact: WERNER LEHNERwerner@lehnerusa.comT: (310)454-7344F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VPWERANAUnique No: 9140881Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Aug 2020
Report Id: VPWERANA [WUSCAR] 05045710 (Generated: 08/31/2023 16:15:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WERNER LEHNER - VPWERANA

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA022754 VPA016713 VPA016722 VPA016714Sample Date 13 Aug 2020 29 Aug 2019 08 Dec 2018 27 May 2018Machine Hours 404 305 199 104Oil Hours 99 106 95 46Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.7 13.7 13.7 13.63Oxidation (PA) % 66 52 60 40
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 0.3 0.7 0.1Nitration (PA) % 49 66 53 33Sulfation (PA) % 55 52 62 42Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 6 8Sodium ppm 4 3 2 3Potassium ppm 3 0 2 7
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 14 14 11 8Copper ppm 5 5 4 5Lead ppm 1 2 1 2Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 3 5 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 16 76 57Nickel ppm 2 <1 1 1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1322 1459 1272 1020Magnesium ppm 690 804 656 1024Zinc ppm 753 805 762 1106Phosphorus ppm 690 688 684 1017Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 156 112 201 2

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPWERANA [WUSCAR] 05045710 (Generated: 08/31/2023 16:15:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WERNER LEHNER - VPWERANA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA A725119\Center Diesel Engine [VPA022754] 13 Aug 2020 @ 404.0 hrs

