
[DAN KRAEMER] 2006004798 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA031592
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)

INTERSTATE POWER SYSTEMS2901 E 78TH STMINNEAPOLIS, MNUS  55425Contact: BRADY GARBRECHTbrady.garbrecht@istate.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain system, andrefill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is lower than acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VP1103105Unique No: 9190442Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 02 Oct 2020
Report Id: VP1103105 [WUSCAR] 05075211 (Generated: 11/27/2023 11:50:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADY GARBRECHT - VP1103105

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA031592 --- --- ---Sample Date 19 Sep 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 613 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.43 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 32 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1103105 [WUSCAR] 05075211 (Generated: 11/27/2023 11:50:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRADY GARBRECHT - VP1103105
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 2006004798\Port Coolant [VPA031592] 19 Sep 2020 @ 613.0 hrs

