
[RAFFY LORENTZIAN] VOLVO PENTA A218121 - STERNDRIVE - STARBOARD GEARBOXSample No: VPA023716
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90

Cogswell Marine & Motorsports, Inc865 Stella StreetCHULA VISTA, CAUS  91911Contact: Mitchell CogswellCogswellmarinemotorsports@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP152133Unique No: 9699785Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Oct 2021
Report Id: VP152133 [WUSCAR] 05375674 (Generated: 05/14/2024 10:06:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mitchell Cogswell - VP152133

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VPA023716 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Oct 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 450 --- --- ---Oil Hours 15 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 108 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 24 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS
PQ 25 --- --- ---Iron ppm 429 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 6 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 31 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 47 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1177 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 198 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152133 [WUSCAR] 05375674 (Generated: 05/14/2024 10:06:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mitchell Cogswell - VP152133
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A218121 - STERNDRIVE\Starboard Gearbox [VPA023716] 08 Oct 2021 @ 450.0 hrs

