
[ALASKA LUXURY TOURS [FARGO]] VOLVO PENTA 3940027304 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA035211
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90

Sundance Mfg Inc570 N.E. Tomahawk Isl. Dr.Portland, ORUS  97217Contact: CLARK HOLMESclark@sundanceyachts.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. No water, ormoisture detected in the sample.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP154394Unique No: 10168855Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Oct 2022
Report Id: VP154394 [WUSCAR] 05664286 (Generated: 08/22/2023 15:57:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CLARK HOLMES - VP154394

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA035211 VPA035062 --- ---Sample Date 04 Oct 2022 11 Jul 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2125 1691 --- ---Oil Hours 434 340 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 104 101 --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 17 14 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 1 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 6 --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 12 26 --- ---Iron ppm 301 114 --- ---Copper ppm 17 16 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 0 11 --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 38 --- ---Zinc ppm 8 11 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1339 1295 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 285 332 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154394 [WUSCAR] 05664286 (Generated: 08/22/2023 15:57:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CLARK HOLMES - VP154394
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3940027304\Port IPS [VPA035211] 04 Oct 2022 @ 2125.0 hrs

