
[ADAM KATZ [JOE]] MERCRUISER 2A399078 - STERNDRIVE - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA055461
Oil Type: {unknown}

BAY MARINE3 E MADISON STWAUKEGAN, ILUS  60085Contact: NANCY FELHOFERNANCY.FELHOFER@BAYMARINE.NETT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The iron level is abnormal.All other component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP1174336Unique No: 10405422Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 03 Apr 2023
Report Id: VP1174336 [WUSCAR] 05807893 (Generated: 01/12/2024 09:49:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NANCY FELHOFER - VP1174336

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055461 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Mar 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 157 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 59 --- --- ---Iron ppm 215 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 5 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 45 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 57 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 6 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 285 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP1174336 [WUSCAR] 05807893 (Generated: 01/12/2024 09:49:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NANCY FELHOFER - VP1174336
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MERCRUISER MERCRUISER 2A399078 - STERNDRIVE\Starboard Gearbox [VPA055461] 27 Mar 2023 @ .0 hrs

