
[LOU BRITO [902598]] VOLVO PENTA 2003011856 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA041464
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA SAE 15W40

Cogswell Marine & Motorsports, Inc865 Stella StreetCHULA VISTA, CAUS  91911Contact: Mitchell CogswellCogswellmarinemotorsports@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Piston, ring and cylinderwear is indicated. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of seal material. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP152133Unique No: 10429334Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 19 Apr 2023
Report Id: VP152133 [WUSCAR] 05821251 (Generated: 10/02/2023 18:04:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mitchell Cogswell - VP152133

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA041464 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Apr 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1407 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 27 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 29 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 194 --- --- ---Copper ppm 40 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 120 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 10 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 65 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 4 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1273 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 768 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1267 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1026 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 99 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152133 [WUSCAR] 05821251 (Generated: 10/02/2023 18:04:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mitchell Cogswell - VP152133
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2003011856\Port Diesel Engine [VPA041464] 10 Apr 2023 @ 1407.0 hrs

