
[STEVE MUCH [PB 50-55]] VOLVO PENTA 3200003459 - PORT IPS
Sample No: VPA047610
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA GL-5 SAE 75W90

GRAND BANKS450 SW SALEM RDSTUART, FLUS  34994Contact: ROBERT ANTONAroberta@gbmarinegroup.comT: (609)384-5290F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Appearance ismilky. There is a high concentrationof water present in the oil. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP531377Unique No: 10460446Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 May 2023
Report Id: VP531377 [WUSCAR] 05841643 (Generated: 07/24/2023 16:14:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT ANTONA - VP531377

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA047610 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 May 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 196 --- --- ---Oil Hours 196 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 395 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 42.6 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3228 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 156 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 52 --- --- ---Iron ppm 68 --- --- ---Copper ppm 16 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 205 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 986 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 34 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1055 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 261 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP531377 [WUSCAR] 05841643 (Generated: 07/24/2023 16:14:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT ANTONA - VP531377
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3200003459\Port IPS [VPA047610] 02 May 2023 @ 196.0 hrs

