
[BOB GUNTHER [G135408]] VOLVO PENTA 70112022390 - STARBOARD DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA050519
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

GRAND BANKS450 SW SALEM RDSTUART, FLUS  34994Contact: ROBERT ANTONAroberta@gbmarinegroup.comT: (609)384-5290F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. Lightfuel dilution occurring. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VP531377Unique No: 10535817Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 02 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP531377 [WUSCAR] 05885334 (Generated: 07/02/2023 12:43:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT ANTONA - VP531377

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA050519 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 121 --- --- ---Oil Hours 121 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 11.2 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 56 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 48 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 2.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 46 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 20 --- --- ---Copper ppm 23 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 55 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2250 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 298 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1242 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1021 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 215 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP531377 [WUSCAR] 05885334 (Generated: 07/02/2023 12:43:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROBERT ANTONA - VP531377
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 70112022390\Starboard Diesel Engine [VPA050519] 21 Jun 2023 @ 121.0 hrs

