
[DICK SMITH [GARRETT]] KONRAD 9812 - STERNDRIVE - STARBOARD GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA048024
Oil Type: TORCO GL-6 FULL SYNTHETIC RACING TRANS FLUID

Bayview Yachtcrafters Inc31785 S. River RoadHARRISON TOWNSHIP, MIUS  48045Contact: Shawn Robertsonbayviewyachtcrafters@comcast.netT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VP151756Unique No: 10537419Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP151756 [WUSCAR] 05886936 (Generated: 07/03/2023 15:20:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shawn Robertson - VP151756

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA048024 VPA031785 VPA026208 VPA027767Sample Date 23 May 2023 25 Jan 2022 19 Aug 2021 01 Aug 2020Machine Hours 196 0 146 0Oil Hours 44 20 22 30Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 56.9 103 104 102
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 3 2 3 3Sodium ppm 0 0 0 0Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALS

PQ 16 22 45 33Iron ppm 266 14 54 27Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 5 3 4 4Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 7 4 8Nickel ppm 2 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm 4 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 9 89 80 181Magnesium ppm 19 25 24 25Zinc ppm 1 46 38 74Phosphorus ppm 288 1391 1424 1375Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 8 320 323 320

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP151756 [WUSCAR] 05886936 (Generated: 07/03/2023 15:20:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Shawn Robertson - VP151756
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KONRAD KONRAD 9812 - STERNDRIVE\Starboard Gearbox [VPA048024] 23 May 2023 @ 196.0 hrs

