
[[TYLER/H.R.]] 1013720600 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA046646
Oil Type: MOBIL DELVAC 1300 SUPER15W40

VIRGINIA PILOT ASSOCIATION3329 SHORE DRVIRGINIA BEACH, VAUS  23451Contact: RYAN BRYANTbryant_j@vapilotassn.comT: (757)692-3439F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VPVIRVIRUnique No: 10537688Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Jul 2023
Report Id: VPVIRVIR [WUSCAR] 05887205 (Generated: 07/03/2023 15:40:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BRYANT - VPVIRVIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA046646 VPA028079 VPA035539 VPA033271Sample Date 19 Jun 2023 28 Sep 2022 21 Apr 2022 12 Nov 2021Machine Hours 8194 7106 6612 6072Oil Hours 582 500 589 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 13.0 13.5 13.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.8 9.1 9.4 ---Oxidation (PA) % 98 94 94 94
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.8 0.7 0.6 0.8Nitration (PA) % 83 86 75 77Sulfation (PA) % 75 76 73 75Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 7 5 6Sodium ppm 4 6 13 34Potassium ppm 4 29 0 2
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 29 17 21 24Copper ppm 2 4 2 4Lead ppm 5 6 2 7Tin ppm <1 1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 13 2 0Chromium ppm 1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 41 37 41 39Nickel ppm 1 1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 2 0 0
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1725 1589 1794 1751Magnesium ppm 503 505 550 502Zinc ppm 932 850 868 879Phosphorus ppm 722 714 782 744Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 32 18 41 28

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPVIRVIR [WUSCAR] 05887205 (Generated: 07/03/2023 15:40:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BRYANT - VPVIRVIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 1013720600\Port Diesel Engine [VPA046646] 19 Jun 2023 @ 8194.0 hrs

