
[JESSE GONZALES] MERCURY 0M971518 - ZEUS POD - GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA030766
Oil Type: MERCURY HIGH PERFORMANCE

Clarks Landing Yacht Sales Inc.1442 Ford RdSHADY SIDE, MDUS  20764Contact: Tom Turnertturner@clarkslanding.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VP565303Unique No: 10547398Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 07 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP565303 [WUSCAR] 05891588 (Generated: 07/07/2023 21:40:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tom Turner - VP565303

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA030766 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 40 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 150 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.353 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 12 --- --- ---Iron ppm 78 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 33 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 10 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 15 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 245 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP565303 [WUSCAR] 05891588 (Generated: 07/07/2023 21:40:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tom Turner - VP565303
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MERCURY MERCURY 0M971518 - ZEUS POD\Gearbox [VPA030766] 05 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

