
[SJ SHERIFF [SAN JOAQUIN SHERIFF]] VOLVO D6-330A-F A227546 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA055519
Oil Type: HYBRID (HOAT) COOLANT

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Appearance is unacceptable.Sediment present. Carboxylate testfailed. The glycol level is lower thanacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10547509Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 10 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 05891699 (Generated: 07/10/2023 19:49:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055519 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.20 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 35.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 05891699 (Generated: 07/10/2023 19:49:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO D6-330A-F A227546\Port Coolant [VPA055519] 23 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

