
[ARON SHEEHAN [ARON SHEEHAN]] VOLVO PENTA 4012181230 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA048733
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA 10W40

ADMIRALTY MARINE2775 KURTZ ST, STE 12SAN DIEGO, CAUS  92110Contact: Terry AlbeeTALBEE@ADMIRALTYMARINE.NETT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Cylinder, crank, or camshaft wear is indicated. Sodiumand/or potassium levels are high. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VP151529Unique No: 10547675Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 11 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP151529 [WUSCAR] 05891865 (Generated: 07/11/2023 15:31:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Terry Albee - VP151529

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA048733 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 350 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 41 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 67 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 48 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 31 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 418 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 44 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 241 --- --- ---Copper ppm 48 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 12 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 69 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1160 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 706 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 773 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 648 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 83 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP151529 [WUSCAR] 05891865 (Generated: 07/11/2023 15:31:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Terry Albee - VP151529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 4012181230\Port Diesel Engine [VPA048733] 29 Jun 2023 @ 350.0 hrs

