
[SUNBERNER] VOLVO PENTA 7011457621 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA055584
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Harry`s Marine Service LLC1141 N. Citrus St.Orange, CAUS  92887Contact: TARAH AULDinfo@harrysmarine.comT: (714)771-7899F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VP867279Unique No: 10552501Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 13 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP867279 [WUSCAR] 05896691 (Generated: 07/23/2023 17:18:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TARAH AULD - VP867279

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA055584 VPA048707 VPA055577 ---Sample Date 10 Jul 2023 05 Jul 2023 28 Jun 2023 ---Machine Hours 414 0 392 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL SEVERE ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 13.41 12.35 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.7 9.2 8.1 ---Oxidation (PA) % 47 51 59 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 0.1 0.2 ---Nitration (PA) % 39 36 48 ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 53 52 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 3.4 3.1 8.8 ---Silicon ppm 4 6 12 ---Sodium ppm 3 3 16 ---Potassium ppm 2 1 3 ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 3 5 8 ---Copper ppm 11 9 29 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 43 40 47 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 877 811 1279 ---Magnesium ppm 588 577 571 ---Zinc ppm 897 828 1064 ---Phosphorus ppm 1090 1039 909 ---Barium ppm 0 2 0 ---Boron ppm 71 85 19 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP867279 [WUSCAR] 05896691 (Generated: 07/23/2023 17:18:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TARAH AULD - VP867279
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7011457621\Port Diesel Engine [VPA055584] 10 Jul 2023 @ 414.0 hrs

