
[RICHARD ALLEN] VOLVO PENTA 7009110631 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA044358
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)

MARINE EVOLUTIONS6831 HILL PARK DRLORTON, VAUS  22079Contact: TIM STAPLESservice@marineevolutions.comT: (702)345-0365F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VP446360Unique No: 10552917Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 16 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP446360 [WUSCAR] 05897107 (Generated: 07/16/2023 20:47:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM STAPLES - VP446360

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA044358 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Jun 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.93 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 300 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 42.2 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -17 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Green --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP446360 [WUSCAR] 05897107 (Generated: 07/16/2023 20:47:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM STAPLES - VP446360
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 7009110631\Port Coolant [VPA044358] 30 Jun 2023 @ .0 hrs

