
7011366155 - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA040885
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 MULTIGRADE 15W40

CHRISTIAN CAVANAUGH130 SHEVELIN RDNOVATO, CAUS  94947Contact: CHRISTIAN CAVANAUGHchristian.cavanaugh@gmail.comT: (415)717-8225F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VPCHRNOVUnique No: 10559724Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: VPCHRNOV [WUSCAR] 05898368 (Generated: 07/18/2023 03:10:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTIAN CAVANAUGH - VPCHRNOV

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA040885 VPA034082 VPA033939 ---Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 13 Jun 2023 08 Jun 2022 ---Machine Hours 10795 10661 9198 ---Oil Hours 100 608 600 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ---Sample Status MARGINAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 11.2 12.2 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 9.6 8.5 ---Oxidation (PA) % 50 60 63 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 0.2 0.2 ---Nitration (PA) % 56 56 59 ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 54 55 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 2.1 4.9 4.7 ---Silicon ppm 3 5 2 ---Sodium ppm 1 0 2 ---Potassium ppm 2 2 <1 ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 3 6 5 ---Copper ppm 8 24 21 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 13 97 50 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1263 1568 1108 ---Magnesium ppm 769 1271 898 ---Zinc ppm 879 1645 1139 ---Phosphorus ppm 744 1404 952 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 71 38 9 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPCHRNOV [WUSCAR] 05898368 (Generated: 07/18/2023 03:10:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRISTIAN CAVANAUGH - VPCHRNOV
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA 7011366155\Port Diesel Engine [VPA040885] 07 Jul 2023 @ 10795.0 hrs

