
[NADINE UCIUOLI [2300819]] VOLVO PENTA 3020295844 - STERNDRIVE - CENTER GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA056012
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W140

Helmuts Marine Service619 Canal StreetSAN RAFAEL, CAUS  94901-3545Contact: NADINE URCIUOLISERVICE@HELMUTSMARINE.COMT:  x:F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP152741Unique No: 10560285Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 05898929 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:50:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA056012 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5647 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 156 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 14 --- --- ---Iron ppm 111 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 7 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 93 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 30 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1916 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 82 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP152741 [WUSCAR] 05898929 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:50:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NADINE URCIUOLI - VP152741
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 3020295844 - STERNDRIVE\Center Gearbox [VPA056012] 06 Jul 2023 @ 5647.0 hrs

