
[FUTURE DEFENSE] CATERPILLAR CS700623 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA044284
Oil Type: CAT DIESEL ENGINE COOLANT (DEAC)

MARINE EVOLUTIONS6831 HILL PARK DRLORTON, VAUS  22079Contact: TIM STAPLESservice@marineevolutions.comT: (702)345-0365F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VP446360Unique No: 10560868Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP446360 [WUSCAR] 05899512 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:50:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM STAPLES - VP446360

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA044284 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 65 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.18 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.6 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP446360 [WUSCAR] 05899512 (Generated: 07/18/2023 16:50:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TIM STAPLES - VP446360
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR CS700623\Port Coolant [VPA044284] 11 Jul 2023 @ 65.0 hrs

