
[NAUTILUS MARINE [ROWE]] MERCRUISER NAUTILUS MARINE (S/N NOT GIVEN) - PORT GASOLINE ENGINE
Sample No: VPA016492
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

NAUTILUS MARINE SERVICEPO BOX 743KEMAH, TXUS  77565Contact: MIKE PAINTERNMSPAINTER@VERIZON.NETT: (281)474-5402F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Recommenddrain oil if not already done and flushbefore refilling with oil. Please notethat there was too much waterpresent in the oil to perform anaccurate viscosity test.Cylinder, crank,or cam shaft wear is indicated.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. The high sodium (Na) levelindicates the possible presence ofsalt water. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. Elemental level of silicon (Si)above normal indicating ingress ofseal material. Test for glycol isnegative. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VPNAUKEMUnique No: 10563124Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 25 Jul 2023
Report Id: VPNAUKEM [WUSCAR] 05901768 (Generated: 08/02/2023 11:37:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE PAINTER - VPNAUKEM

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA016492 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 31.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 32 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 13.8 --- --- ---Soot % % 0.6 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 47 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 0 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 31 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 508 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 28 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 246 --- --- ---Copper ppm 54 --- --- ---Lead ppm 10 --- --- ---Tin ppm 5 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 16 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 33 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1768 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 132 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 747 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 659 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 68 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPNAUKEM [WUSCAR] 05901768 (Generated: 08/02/2023 11:37:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE PAINTER - VPNAUKEM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MERCRUISER MERCRUISER NAUTILUS MARINE (S/N NOT GIVEN)\Port Gasoline Engine [VPA016492] 01 Jul 2023 @ .0 hrs

