
[KENNEDY [HS]] VOLVO PENTA KENNEDY (S/N N/A) - CENTER DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA044067
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

Point Judith Marina360 Gooseberry RoadWAKEFIELD, RIUS  02879Contact: MATT ST. ANGELOservice@pjmarina.com;canastasio@wearcheckusa.comT: (401)789-7189F: (401)783-5350
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP153811Unique No: 10576300Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 30 Jul 2023
Report Id: VP153811 [WUSCAR] 05909648 (Generated: 08/01/2023 10:05:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT ST. ANGELO - VP153811

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA044067 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 299 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 16.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 87 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 2.7 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 112 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 78 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 24 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 65 --- --- ---Copper ppm 195 --- --- ---Lead ppm 20 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 18 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2504 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 44 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1373 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 983 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 107 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP153811 [WUSCAR] 05909648 (Generated: 08/01/2023 10:05:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT ST. ANGELO - VP153811
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA KENNEDY (S/N N/A)\Center Diesel Engine [VPA044067] 01 Jul 2023 @ 299.0 hrs

