
[SCARLETE RINER] VOLVO PENTA 1013897351 (S/N 101397351) - PORT DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA051763
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40

NEWT MARINE5 JONES STDUBUQUE, IAUS  52001Contact: DON LEIKservice@newtmarine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. In theabsence of other significant wearmetals, suspect copper due tosources other than wear (i.e. coolingcore). All other component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of fuel present in the oil. Fuelis present in the oil and is loweringthe viscosity. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil.

Depot: VP99298099Unique No: 10593022Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 11 Aug 2023
Report Id: VP99298099 [WUSCAR] 05921108 (Generated: 08/11/2023 14:14:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON LEIK - VP99298099

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051763 VPA034045 VPA038790 ---Sample Date 23 Jul 2023 22 Feb 2023 05 Aug 2022 ---Machine Hours 1623 1032 605 ---Oil Hours 589 1032 605 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 11.3 11.2 11.6 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.8 7.8 9.8 ---Oxidation (PA) % 77 76 77 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 ---Nitration (PA) % 78 76 72 ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 61 63 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 7.4 6.3 6.3 ---Silicon ppm 20 18 20 ---Sodium ppm 3 0 5 ---Potassium ppm 28 31 29 ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 20 19 15 ---Copper ppm 234 288 7 ---Lead ppm 4 1 2 ---Tin ppm 2 2 3 ---Aluminum ppm 12 12 12 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 54 55 51 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 2 1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1227 1230 1159 ---Magnesium ppm 874 787 748 ---Zinc ppm 1225 1141 1115 ---Phosphorus ppm 925 946 886 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 7 11 18 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP99298099 [WUSCAR] 05921108 (Generated: 08/11/2023 14:14:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON LEIK - VP99298099
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 1013897351 (S/N 101397351)\Port Diesel Engine [VPA051763] 23 Jul 2023 @ 1623.0 hrs

