
[PINO] PINO - CENTER DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA049921
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

Full Performance Marine IncIntersection of Rt. 26&994JAMES CREEK, PAUS  16657Contact: DAVID WEAVERdavid@fullperformancemarine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We advise that youcheck for the source of water entry.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a highamount of fuel present in the oil.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil.

Depot: VP410493Unique No: 10608019Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: VP410493 [WUSCAR] 05928072 (Generated: 08/22/2023 12:13:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID WEAVER - VP410493

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA049921 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 200 --- --- ---Oil Hours 35 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 7.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 41 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 0.644 --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 69 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 44 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 8.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 13 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 17 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 90 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 71 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1081 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 416 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 725 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 615 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 91 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP410493 [WUSCAR] 05928072 (Generated: 08/22/2023 12:13:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID WEAVER - VP410493
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PINO\Center Diesel Engine [VPA049921] 15 Aug 2023 @ 200.0 hrs

