
[105200 [GALATI 105200]] VOLVO PENTA A1052141 - STERNDRIVE - PORT GEARBOX
Sample No: VPA044386
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

Suncoast Diesel Marine Inc.610 Mount Vernan StOLDSMAR, FLUS  34677Contact: MARK WARRENoldsmar@suncoastdmi.comT: (813)475-5942F: (813)475-5943
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The highsodium (Na) level indicates thepossible presence of salt water. Theoil is no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP945077Unique No: 10615286Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Aug 2023
Report Id: VP945077 [WUSCAR] 05930015 (Generated: 08/24/2023 15:57:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK WARREN - VP945077

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA044386 VPA047027 VPA034860 ---Sample Date 14 Aug 2023 11 Jul 2022 02 Jun 2021 ---Machine Hours 211 172 70 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 101 105 97.9 ---
 CONTAMINATION

Water % 1.06 0.977 --- ---Silicon ppm 3 2 2 ---Sodium ppm 78 71 16 ---Potassium ppm 4 0 1 ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 15 17 31 ---Iron ppm 265 474 185 ---Copper ppm <1 2 2 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 6 5 2 ---Chromium ppm 3 5 5 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 1 ---Nickel ppm 13 7 4 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 4 <1 ---Manganese ppm 3 8 20 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 126 13 52 ---Magnesium ppm 17 10 6 ---Zinc ppm 20 17 32 ---Phosphorus ppm 1500 1335 1340 ---Barium ppm 0 0 3 ---Boron ppm 260 292 225 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP945077 [WUSCAR] 05930015 (Generated: 08/24/2023 15:57:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK WARREN - VP945077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA A1052141 - STERNDRIVE\Port Gearbox [VPA044386] 14 Aug 2023 @ 211.0 hrs

