
[BEN HAMMOND [HAMMOND]] VOLVO PENTA 2003018774 - CENTER DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA046490
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 15W40

Thomaston Boat & Engine Works Inc.2 Atlantic HwyTHOMASTON, MEUS  04861Contact: Patrick Riccipricci@mindspring.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Cylinder, crank, or camshaft wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP619387Unique No: 10642225Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP619387 [WUSCAR] 05946266 (Generated: 09/13/2023 15:09:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Patrick Ricci - VP619387

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA046490 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 196 --- --- ---Oil Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 14.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 53 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 14 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 13 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 166 --- --- ---Copper ppm 20 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 35 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2206 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 31 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1223 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 957 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 175 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP619387 [WUSCAR] 05946266 (Generated: 09/13/2023 15:09:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Patrick Ricci - VP619387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO PENTA VOLVO PENTA 2003018774\Center Diesel Engine [VPA046490] 05 Sep 2023 @ 196.0 hrs

