
H070099258 - PORT COOLANT
Sample No: VPA050729
Oil Type: EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT

ADVANCED DIESEL1029 INDUSTRIAL BLVD, UNIT 2NAPLES, FLUS  34104Contact: KEITH SPICERkeith_advanceddiesel@yahoo.comT: (239)580-8731F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VPADVNAPUnique No: 10643610Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 12 Sep 2023
Report Id: VPADVNAP [WUSCAR] 05947651 (Generated: 09/12/2023 16:48:49) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: KEITH SPICER - VPADVNAP

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA050729 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1253 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 8.28 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 224 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 45.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -24 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VPADVNAP [WUSCAR] 05947651 (Generated: 09/12/2023 16:48:52) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: KEITH SPICER - VPADVNAP
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ONAN H070099258\Port Coolant [VPA050729] 07 Sep 2023 @ 1253.0 hrs

