
[STILLMAN] PARAGON TMI-14639 - INBOARD TRANSMISSION (AUTO)
Sample No: VPA036754
Oil Type: OREILLY PREM ATF DEX/MERC

TRUE NORTH MARINE1206 MARINA BAY DRCLEAR LAKE SHORES, TXUS  77565Contact: Brian Rogersb.rogers@truenorth-marine.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VP975860Unique No: 10645503Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 15 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP975860 [WUSCAR] 05949544 (Generated: 09/15/2023 16:55:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Brian Rogers - VP975860

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA036754 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 40°C cSt 36.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Silicon ppm 19 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

PQ 35 --- --- ---Iron ppm 19 --- --- ---Copper ppm 40 --- --- ---Lead ppm 11 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 122 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 74 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 316 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 73 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP975860 [WUSCAR] 05949544 (Generated: 09/15/2023 16:55:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Brian Rogers - VP975860
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PARAGON PARAGON TMI-14639\Inboard Transmission (Auto) [VPA036754] 11 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

