
CUMMINS 46387757 - DIESEL ENGINE
Sample No: VPA045504
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40

Walstrom Marine501 Bay StreetHARBOR SPRINGS, MIUS  49740Contact: MARK LEWISmlewis@walstrom.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. Confirm oil type. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VP154879Unique No: 10647187Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 18 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 05951228 (Generated: 09/18/2023 10:19:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK LEWIS - VP154879

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA045504 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 11.0 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 25 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 26 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 36 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.2 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 74 --- --- ---Lead ppm 100 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 112 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 2480 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 93 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1110 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 985 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 10 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP154879 [WUSCAR] 05951228 (Generated: 09/18/2023 10:19:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK LEWIS - VP154879
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS CUMMINS 46387757\Diesel Engine [VPA045504] 11 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

