
CATERPILLAR 3JK1094 - COOLANT
Sample No: VPA051725
Oil Type: CAT EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT (ELC)

Edward`s Marine and Sons12741 Sunset AveOCEAN CITY, MDUS  21842Contact: Edward Bartholmeedwardsmarine@comcast.net;canastasio@wearcheckusa.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VP551029Unique No: 10649097Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP551029 [WUSCAR] 05953138 (Generated: 09/21/2023 06:18:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Edward Bartholme - VP551029

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA051725 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 500 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITION

pH Scale 0-14 7.97 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 49.5 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Red --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP551029 [WUSCAR] 05953138 (Generated: 09/21/2023 06:18:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Edward Bartholme - VP551029
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 3JK1094\Coolant [VPA051725] 14 Sep 2023 @ 500.0 hrs

