
[E-PAD] CUMMINS/ONAN J200834730 - STARBOARD GENSET
Sample No: VPA049891
Oil Type: VOLVO PENTA SAE 15W40

Marine International Diesels Inc.3600 HACIENDA BLVD UNIT GDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: ASHANTI BURKEaburke@midiflorida.comT: (954)761-1086F: (954)761-1186
Diagnosis
We recommend that you change theoil at the next available stoppage oroutage. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of fuel present in the oil.Tests confirm the presence of fuel inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Fuel is present in the oiland is lowering the viscosity. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VP694356Unique No: 10649109Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 05953150 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:30:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ASHANTI BURKE - VP694356

 SAMPLE INFORMATION

Sample Number VPA049891 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 82 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION

Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION

Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 5.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 12 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS

Iron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 10 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 59 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES

Calcium ppm 1853 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 675 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1022 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 807 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 56 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VP694356 [WUSCAR] 05953150 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:30:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ASHANTI BURKE - VP694356
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS/ONAN CUMMINS/ONAN J200834730\Starboard Genset [VPA049891] 14 Sep 2023 @ 81.6 hrs

